O 00 N N U R W N

[ N S T N S S R 1 I O L O T N T N e g S S Y
00 9 O WU A W N = O VW 0NN W AW =D

BILL NO. 2005-19
ORDINANCE NO.
AN ORDINANCE TO ADOPT THE lNTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, 2003
EDITION, ALONG WITH THE DOCUMENT ENTITLED “2003 SOUTHERN NEVADA
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE AMENDMENTS,” ASREPLACEMENTS

FOR THE MODEL ENERGY CODE, 1992 EDITION, AND THE SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENT
AMENDING THAT CODE, AND TO PROVIDE FOR OTHER RELATED MATTERS.

Proposed by: Paul Wilkins, Directorof Building =~ Summary: Adopts the International Energy
and Safety Conservation Code, 2003 Edition, along with the
_ document entitled “2003 Southern Nevada
International Energy Conservation Code
Amendments,” as replacements for the Model
Energy Code, 1992 Edition, and the
Supplemental Document amending that code.
THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LAS VEGAS DOES HEREBY ORDAIN
AS FOLLOWS: | | .
SECTION 1: Title 16, Chapter 52, Section 10, of the Municipal Code of the City of
Las Vegas, Nevada, 1983 Edition, is hereby amended to read as follows:
16.52.010:  Those certain d'dcurnents, three copies of which are on file in the Office of the City
Clerk and are designated as follows, are adopted by reference as if set forth herein in full:
(A)  Thepublication entitled [“The Model Energy Code, 1992 Edition,” as published
by the Council of American Building Officials,] “International Energy Conservation Code, 2003
Edition,” as published by the International Code Council, as Part 1 of this Chapter; and
.(B) The document entitled [“A Supplemental Document Ar'nending.thé Model

Energy Code, 1992 Edition,”] “2003 Southern Nevada International Energy Conservation Code

Amendments,” which adds to, deletes from and ameﬁds the [Model Energy Code, 1992 Edition,)
“International Energy Conservation Code, 2003 Edition,” as Part 2 of this Chapter. | |
SECTION 2: The document entitled “2003 Southern Nevada International Energy
Conservation Code Amendments,” referred to in Section 1 of this Ordinance, is attached hereto.
SECTION 3: The document entitled “A Supplemental Document Amending the
Model Energy Code, 1992 Edition,” is hereby repealed. A
SECTION 4: Ordinance No. 5636 of the City of Las Vegas, which adopted the 2003




O 00 2 O W» B W N

10
11
12

13

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

- 25

26
27
28

Edition of the International Building Code and the City of Las Vegas Amendments to the 2003
International Building Code, is hereby amended as set forth in Section 5 of this Ordinance.

SECTION 5: Subsection 1301.1.1 of the International Building Code is deleted in its
entirety and replaced with a new Subsection 1301.1.1, reading as follows:

1301.1.1 Criteria. Buildings shal] be designed and constructed in accordance with the
International Energy Conservation Code, 2003 Edition, and the “2003 Southern Nevada
International Energy Conservation Code Amendments,” as adopted by Chapter 16.52 of the
Las Vegas Municipﬁl Code.

SECTION 6 Ordinance No. 5636 of the City of Las Vegas, which adopted the 2003
Edition of the International Residential Code and the City of Las Vegas Amendments to the 2003
Intemat.ional Residential Code, is hereby amended as set forth in Section 7 of this Ordinance.

SECTION 7: Section N1101 of the International Residential Code, including its
constituent subsections, is deleted in its entirety and replaced with anew Section N1101, together with
a new Subsection N1101.1 and a new Subsection N1 101.1.1, reading as follows:

SECT IONN1101 GENERAL
- Subéection N1101.1 Scope. This section governs the design and construction of buildings
for energy efficiency.
Subsection N1101.1.1 Criteria. Buildings shall be designed and constructed in accordance
with the International Energy Conservation Code, 2003 Editioﬁ, and the “2003 Southern
Nevada International Energy Conservation Code M¢ndments,” as adopted by Chapter 16.52
of the Las Vegas Municipal Code.

SECTION 8: If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, senténc'e,A clause or
phrase in this ordinance or any part thereof is for any reason held to be unconstitutional or invalid or
ineffective by any court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity or
effectiveness of the remaining portions of this ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council of the
City of Las Vegas hereby declares that it would hav'e passed each section, subsection, subdivision,
paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections,

subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared unconstitutional,

2-




O 00 3 O WV AW e

[ S R L T N e O e N e N 1 2 1 T SO S S
00 N O W AW = O Y 00NV R W N e O

invalid or ineffective.

SECTION9: All ordinances or parts of ordinances or sections, subsectidns, phrases,
sentences, clauses or paragraphs contained in the Municipal Code of the City of Las Vegas, Nevada,
1983 Edition, in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

PASSED, ADOPTED and APPROVED this __ dayof , 2005.

APPROVED:
By
OSCAR B. GOODMAN, Mayor
ATTEST:

BARBARA JO RONEMUS, City Clerk
APPROVED AS TO FORM:

/a,éﬂ@/ 2-23-0

Date




O 00 2 O W AW N -

N NN NN NN NN e e et e e e e fmed e
00 N N Wn AW N = O VO 0N Y R WD = O

The above and foregoing ordinance was first proposed and read by title to the City Council on the

_____ day of , 2005, and referred to the following committee composed of
and ’ for recommendation;

thereaﬁér the said committee reported favorably on said ordinance on the - day of
| , 2005, which was a meeting of said Council; that at said

meeting, the proposed ordinance was read by title to the City Council

as first introduced and adopted by the following vote:

VOTING “AYE”:
VOTING “NAY”:
ABSENT:
" APPROVED:
By
' OSCAR B. GOODMAN, Mayor
ATTEST:

BARBARA JO RONEMUS, City Clerk

FACMORGAN\CIViL\agenda items\2005\4-6-05\2005-19.wpd ‘4‘




2003
SOUTHERN NEVADA
INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

AMENDMENTS

February 1, 2005

JURISDICTIONS CONSIDERINC ADOPTION:

Clark County

4701 W. Russell Rd.

Las Vegas, Nevada 89118
(702) 455-3030
Inspections 455-8040

Boulder City

'401 California Ave.
Boulder City, NV. 89005
(702) 293-9282

North Las Vegas
2266 Civic Center Dr.

North Las Vegas, NV 89030

(702) 633-1577
Inspections 633-1576

City of Las Vegas
731'S. 4™ Street
Las Vegas, Nevada 89155
(702) 229-6251
Inspections 229-2071

City of Mesquite
10 East Mesquite Blvd.

. Mesquite, NV, 89027
(702) 346-2835

City of Henderson
240 Water Street
Henderson, NV 89015
(702) 267-3600

- Inspections 267-3900



PPV SO PR SO

Joint Jurisdiction Amendment to the 2003 International Energy Conservation Code
Page -2-

PREFACE

This document comprises the Southern Nevada Amendments to the 2003 International
Energy Conservation Code as published by the International Code Council (ICC). It was
developed by the jurisdictions listed on the cover page, the Association of General
Contractors. (AGC) and the Southern Nevada Home Builders Association (SNHBA) as a
document to be adopted by reference. These provisions are not code unless adopted and
codified by governmental jurisdictions. These amendments are not intended to prevent
the use of any material or method of construction not specifically prescribed herein,
provided any alternates have been approved and its use authorized by the building
official. This document is available to be adopted as code by any jurisdiction without
permission or approval from the jurisdictions listed on the cover page.




Joint Jurisdiction Amendment to the 2003 International Energy Conservation Code
Page -3-

Section 101.1 Title (p.1)
Revise section 101.1 as follows:

101.1 Title These regulations shall be known as the Energy Con&ervation Code of
Southern Nevada, and shall be cited as such. It is referred to herein as “this code.”

Section 107.3 (p.4)
Add a new section that reads as follows:

107.3 Referenced Codes. Where this code refers to other codes not adopted by the
jurisdiction, the applicable code adopted by the jurisdiction shall govern.

Section 202 Definitions (p.6 -9)

Revise the definition of “Conditioned Space” by adding a second sentence that reads as
follows:

Conditioned Space: A heated or cooled space, or both, within a building and, where
required, provided with humidification or dehumidification means so as to be capable of
maintaining a space condition falling within the comfort envelope set forth in ASHRAE
'55. Supplemental heating required for the protection of wet fire protection systems
(freeze protection to 42 degrees) or the sole use of evaporative cooling does not fall
within the scope of this definition.

Revise Section 202 by adding the following definitions:

Sign. An interior or exterior lighted device used to impart way-finding, identifications or f
promotional information to the viewer. Signs include, but are not limited to business
identification, location maps, gaming boards, sports scoreboards, and slot carousels

identifiers.

Task Lighting. Lighting devices, either plug and cord connected or hard wiréd, 6 feet.or
less above the work surface that provides lighting for a particular work surface or task.



Joint Jurisdiction Amendment to the 2003 International Energy Conservation Code
Page -4-

Table 302.1 Eiterior Design Conditions (p.11)

Table 302:1 is amended to read as follows:

Table 302.1
Exterior Design Conditions®

Condition Value
Winter®, Design Dry-bulb (°F) 1 27°F
Summer®, Design Dry-bulb (°F) 106 °F
Summer®, Design Wet-bulb (°F) 66 °F
Degree Days Heating” 2238
Degree Days Cooling” 3213
Climate Zone® 5B

For SI: °C = [(°F)-32)/1.8.

a. The outdoor design temperature shall be selected from the columns of 97'% percent values for
winter and 2% percent values for summer from tables in the ASHRAE Fundamental Handbook.
Adjustments shall be permitted to reflect local climates, which differ from the tabulated

temperatures, or local weather experience determined by the code official.

b. The degree-days heating (base 65 °F) and cooling (base 65 °F) shall be selected from NOAA
“Annual Degree Days to Selected Bases Derived from the 1971-2000 Normals,” data available
from adjacent mllxtary installations, or other.source of local weather data acceptable to the code

official.

c. The climate zone shall be selected from the applicable map provided in Figures 902.1(1) through

902.1(51) in Chapter 9 of this code.
d. For elevations greater than 6000 feet, see local jurisdiction for design conditions.

Section 402.2.2.1 Orientation for groups of buildings. (p-13)

Revise section 402.2.2.1 to read as follows:

402.2.2.1 Orientation for groups of buildings. The worst pdssible orientation of the
proposed design, in terms of annual energy use, considering north, east, south, and west
orientations, shall be used to represent groups of otherwise identical designs (including

reversed or mirror plans).

Section 402.3.3 Site Energy (p.16)

Revise Sec_tion 402.3.3 to read as follows:

402.3.3 Site Energy. The different energy sources shall be compafed on the basis of

source energy use at the site where: 1kWh =3 x 3,413 Btu’s. (= 10,239 Btu’s.)



Joint Jurisdiction Améndm_ent to the 2003 International Energy Conservation Code
Page -5-

Section 502.1.1 Moisture Control (p.17),
Revise section 502.1.1 by adding the following exception:

502.1.1 Moisture Control. The design shall not create a condition of accelerated
deterioration from moisture condensation. Frame walls, floors and ceilings not ventilated
to allow moisture to escape shall be provnded w1th an approved vapor retarder having a
permeance rated of 1 perm (5.7 x 10" kg/Pa s m ) or less, when tested in accordance
with the desiccant method using Procedure A of ASTM E 96. The vapor retarder shall be
installed on the warm-in-winter side of the thermal insulations.

Exceptions:

1. In construction where moisture or its freezmg will not damage the
materials.

2. Where the county in which the building is being constructed is considered

a hot and humid climate area and identified as such in Flgures 902.1 (1)
through 902.1(51) in Chapter 9 of this code.

3. Where other approved means to avoid condensation in unventilated
framed wall, floor, roof and ceiling cavities are provided.
4, Frame walls, floors and ceilings in jurisdictions in Zone 5b (Crawl space

floor vapor retarders are not exempted.)



Joint Jurisdiction Amendment to the 2003 International Energy Conservation Code

Page -6-

Table 502.2 Heating and Cooling Criteria (p.18)

Table 502.2 is amended to read as follows:

Table 502.2

Heating and Cooling Criteria®
Detached One- Group R-2, R4
and Two-Family or Townhouses
Dwellings

Element Mode Uo Up

Walls Heating or cooling 0.19 - 0.27

Roof/Ceiling Heating or cooling 0.37 0.37

Floors over unheated Heating or cooling 0.07 0.07

spaces

Heatelfi fSlab on Heating R-value =6 R-value = 6

grade™

Unhe?fffd slab on Heating R-value =0 R-value =0

grade™” :

Basement wall®' Heating or cooling U-factor = 0.15 U-factor = 0.15

Crawl space wall® | Heating or cooling U-factor = 0.14 U-factor = 0.14

For SI: 1 Btwhr-fF = 5.678 W/(m>K), °C=[(F)-32)/1.8

a.

For projects where the building official has determined that the Climate Data is not consistent
with that of the Las Vegas Valley, values shall be determined by using the graphs [Figures
502.2.(1), 502.2(2), 502.2(3), 502.2(4), 502.2(5) and 502.2(6)] using HDD determined by
either the building official or a creditable climate source.

There are no insulation requirements for heated slabs in locations having less than 500 HDD.
There are no insulation requirements for unheated slabs in locations having less than 2,500

HDD.

Slab edge insulation is not required for unheated slabs in areas of very heavy termite
infestation probability in accordance with Section 502.2.1.4 and as shown in Figure 502.2.(7).
Basement and crawl spaces wall U-factors shall be based on the wall components and surface
air film. Adjacent soil shall not be considered in the determinations of the U-factor.

Typical foundation insulation techniques can be found in the DOE Building Foundation

Design Handbook.

Table -502.2.5 Prescriptive Envelope Component Criteria Additions and
Replacement Windows for Existing Detached One- and Two-Family Dwellings

(0.39)

Table 502.2.5 is amended to read as follows;



